
FP News Service 
LALITPUR 

The Lalitpur Police have 
launched a 90-day special  
campaign under the fifth 
phase of Mission Shakti, co-
inciding with Sharadiya Nav-
ratri festival to ensure safety, 
dignity and empowerment of 
women and children.  

Under the direction of 
Superintendent of Police (SP) 
Mohammad Mushtaq and 
supervision of Additional 
Superintendent of Police Anil 
Kumar, the campaign aims to 
spread awareness about cyber 

crime and women’s empower-
ment among students. 

The Mission Shakti team on 
Sunday visited Chandi Mata 
Temple to raise awareness 
among young girls.  

They were educated about 
the dangers of cyber crime 
and informed about various 

government schemes related 
to women’s welfare. Addi-
tionally, a Kanya Janmotsav 
programme was organised at 
the women’s hospital to cel-
ebrate the birth of girls to sup-
port Beti Bachao Beti Padhao 
initiative. 

During the campaign, in-

formation on government 
schemes like Mukhyamantri 
Kanya Sumangala Yojana, 
Ujjwala Scheme and Ayush-
man Bharat was shared.  

Helpline numbers for 
women’s safety, cyber crime 
and health services were also 
provided, ensuring that com-
munity is well-informed about 
resources available for ad-
dressing issues related to viol-
ence against women.

Our Staff Reporter 
BHOPAL 

Congress has constituted two 
committees for the by-elec-
tions scheduled for Vijaypur 
and Budhni constituencies, 
said party leaders here on 
Sunday.  

The Bidhni Assembly seat 
became vacant after former 
chief minister Shivraj Singh 
Chouhan fought Parliament 
election and was made Union 

agriculture minister, while 
the election in Vijaypur As-
sembly seat has been 
necessitated after Congress 
MLA Ram Niwas Rawat 
crossed over to BJP and be-
came minister. The charge of 
Budhni assembly seat has 
been given to the former 
union minister Arun Yadav 
along with the former MLAs 
Sajjan Singh Verma and 
Shailendra Patel.  

Arun Yadav had contested 

the assembly election in 2018, 
against Shivraj Singh Chou-
han and managed to garner 
around 31% votes and Chou-
han had secured more than 
60% of votes.  

The responsibility of Vijay-
pur constituency has been 
given to Rajya Sabha member 
Ashok Singh. The other 
members of the committee 
are MLA Jaivardhan Singh, 
ex-MLA Lakhan Singh Yadav 
and Neetu Sikarwar. 
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4-day Bhasa 
Mahima ends 
with Mohe Piya   
Our Staff Reporter 
BHOPAL 

India boasts of many great 
playwrights including 
Bhasa, Bhavabhuti and Kali-
das but due to our narrow 
thinking, we never took the 
works of these playwrights 
outside India, said chairman 
of Bharat Bhavan Trust and 
former NSD director Vaman 
Kendre.   

“The playwrights of Nor-
way were taken all over the 
world. Considering the diver-
sity in the plays here, we 
should consider staging them 
abroad,” he added. 

Kendre was speaking at a 
discussion session on, Ra-
mayana-Mahabharata  Aur 
Bhas Ka  Rangmanch, at Bha-
rat Bhavan on Sunday - the  
concluding day of four-day 
Bhasa Mahima organised by 
Trust for the first time.  

Our Staff Reporter 
BHOPAL 

Amid the southwest mon-
soon’s withdrawal from Mad-
hya Pradesh, warm and humid 
conditions prevailed during 
the daytime in Bhopal and 
other cities. The mercury level 
is above the season’s normal, 
and these weather conditions 
are likely to persist for the next 
week or so. Temperatures will 
continue to rise in parts of the 
state. 

The festivities of ‘Navratri’ 
are likely to experience these 
conditions for the remaining 
days. A gradual change is ex-
pected thereafter, leading to 
typical autumn, pleasant 
weather. The key highlights of 

the current weather include 
above-average maximum tem-
peratures, a dip in mercury 
during the late evening and 
night, and hazy mornings  and 
bright and sunny days. 

Bhopal recorded day tem-
perature of 34 degree Celsius 
which was 0.9 degrees Celsius 
above normal while it re-
corded 21.6 degrees Celsius at 
night. Indore recorded 32.6 de-
grees Celsius while the mini-
mum temperature stood at 
21.6 degrees Celsius. 

In the wake of withdrawal 
of monsoon, such conditions 
are very evident and remain 
prevalent, according to me-
teorological department offi-
cials.  The last week of October 
is synonymous with the pleas-

ant feel of wintry flavor. There 
is no significant weather sys-
tem around the city and ex-
tended neighbourhood. A 
feeble and dry circulation is 

marked in the lower levels.   
South-west monsoon is 

likely to withdraw from the 
entire state within the next 
couple of days. It has with-

drawn from districts—Nee-
much, Mandsaur, Ratlam, Uj-
jain, Dewas, Agar, Shajapur, 
Bhopal, Sehore, Vidisha, 
Raisen, Rajgarh, Guna, Ashok 
Nagar, Jhabua, Alirajpur, 
Bhadwani, Dhar, Indore, Khar-
gone, Khandwa, Harda, Nar-
madapura, Sagar, Damoh, 
Tikamgarh, Niwari, Chhatar-
pur, Panna.

AUTUMN SETS IN | Rains disappear in state, bringing warmth & comfort

Warm, humid conditions 
prevail in Bhopal, other cities
Dip in temperature in late evening, night Rains likely 

in 10 dist 
Sporadic spell of 

heavy-moderate rain 
likely in districts Khar-
gone, Barwani, Gwalior, 
Morena, Singrauli, Sidhi, 
Anuppur, Chhindwara, 
Seoni and Balaghat in 
next 24 hours. 

Congress forms committees for 
Vijaypur and Budhni bypolls

Chhatarpur police bust inter-state 
theft gang, arrest three accused
Stolen booty worth 
Rs 6 lakh seized 
FP News Service 
CHHATARPUR 

The Chhatarpur police on 
Sunday busted an interstate 
theft gang, arresting three in-
dividuals involved in a series of 
burglaries in Garhi Malhara 
area. The accused Dheeraj 
Ahirwar, Ramkishan Shrivas, 
and buyer Shatrughan alias 

Anoop Soni, were found with 
6 tolas of gold, 1 kg of silver,  
Rs 30,000 in cash and two mo-
bile phones amounting to over 
?6 lakh in recovered property. 

The theft took place on Sep-
tember 20 when four houses in 
ward 1 of Garhi Malhara were 

burgled. Police gathered evi-
dence and arrested the suspects 
near Chhatarpur bus stand. The 
investigation revealed that Soni, 
a known gangster, had prior of-
fences registered in Mahoba 
under Gangster Act. Further in-
vestigations are underway to 
track down additional accom-
plices and recover the remain-
ing stolen items. Inspector 
Dharmendra Kumar Singh and 
his team played key roles in the 
operation. 

Police launch Mission Shakti to 
ensure safety of women & kids

Man booked 
for molesting, 
assaulting 
Class 7 girl  
Our Staff Reporter 
BHOPAL 

A 23-year-old man alleg-
edly molested a Class 7 girl 
twice and assaulted her 
when she protested, 
Chhola police said on Sun-
day. The police have regis-
tered a case against the 
accused, who is at large. 

Chhola police station TI 
Suresh Chandra Nagar told 
Free Press that 12-year-old 
girl had gone to the terrace 
of her house on September 
23 and Shadab also reached 
there through terrace of 
adjoining houses. He 
clasped the girl’s hand 
tightly but when she 
screamed, the accused fled. 

Again on Saturday, Sha-
dab repeated the act, but 
when the girl protested 
again, Shadab allegedly as-
saulted her and threatened 
her with dire con-
sequences before fleeing. 
On Sunday, the girl and her 
kin approached police and 
lodged a complaint.  

The police have begun 
searching for the accused.

UBI felicitates officials on 
Hindi fortnight conclusion

Our Staff Reporter 
BHOPAL 

Union Bank of India felicitated 
winners of various pro-
gramme held for the promo-
tion of Rajbhasha during 
Hindi Fortnight which con-
cluded on Sunday 

Zonal head of Union Bank of 
India Biraja Prasad Das, Dep-
uty Zonal manager Arvind 
Kumar Surala, Regional head 

Javed Ahmed Jaffrey and 
others were present on the oc-
casion. Das called upon bank 
officials to work in Hindi. 
“Hindi is the need of the hour. 
Without Hindi, we cannot pro-
vide better banking service to 
customers,” said the zonal 
head. Raj Bhasha officer Anu-
rag Kumar Singh said, “ Hindi 
use should not be restricted to 
only Hindi Diwas, rather, it 
should be used every day.”

The teachers, 
whose data has 
not been 
updated in the 
portal, have been 
working for free  
Our Staff Reporter 
BHOPAL 

Amid the ongoing demands 
for regularisation by guest 
teachers, technical issues with 
the guest teachers’ portal are 
adding to their problems. Sev-
eral teachers are unable to ac-
cess the portal, which is 
critical for their official recog-
nition and employment status. 
Without details being entered 
into the system, several other 
guest teachers are at risk of 
losing their jobs permanently. 
They fear that if the situation is 
not rectified soon, they will 
not be able to continue work-
ing as guest teachers, causing 
immense anxiety and financial 
strain. The guest teachers, 

whose data has not been up-
dated in the portal, have been 
working for free for the entire 
academic year without receiv-
ing any payment. 

In Bhind district, one such 
case has come to light. Guest 
teacher Parshuram Gurjar, 
who was appointed in July 
2023, has been facing severe 
difficulties because his details 
have not been uploaded to the 
portal. He is frequently visiting 
the Directorate of Public In-
struction (DPI) in an attempt 
to resolve the issue, however, 
despite his efforts, no solution 
has been provided. 

He alleged that the school 
principal demanded a bribe of 
Rs 25,000 to process the 
necessary paperwork and en-
sure his portal feeding was 
completed. He was the sole 
person managing a school 
with zero permanent teaching 
staff, conducting all classes for 
the entire academic session. 
Yet, despite his dedication, he 
has not been compensated 
even a single rupee for his 
work, he stated. 

2 caught on camera, 
installed schemer  
in machine
Our Staff Reporter 
BHOPAL 

The Chunabhatti police pro-
bing the incident in which an 
ATM booth located in Manisha 
Market of Shahpura was alleg-
edly hacked and two persons 
were duped of Rs 2.2 lakh, ob-
tained another lead on Sunday. 
The police said two men who 
had been installing a device to 
clone the ATM card inserted 
into the machine have been 
caught on the CCTV camera.  

In the CCTV camera foot-
ages, one unidentified person 
is seen installing schemer in 
the machine while the other 
man is guarding ATM booth to 
alert the man present inside.  
According to Chunabhatti po-
lice station TI Bhupinder Kaul 
Siddhu, the device, which was 
installed in ATM machine is 
called schemer. With the help 

of schemer, the crooks clone 
the cards of people who insert 
their ATM card into the ma-
chine and thus gain access to 
their bank accounts to siphon 
off money from there. 

She said police were cur-
rently tracing IP address of 
schemer with the help of 
which they would trace the 
whereabouts of accused and 
nab them. 

SHAHPURA ATM BOOTH HACKING

Salt, sugar, maida 
responsible for it 
as youths prefer 
fast food: Expert 
OUR STAFF REPORTER 
BHOPAL 

Hypertension prevalence 
among  people who are 20 
years and  above  is 35.5 per 
cent with urban areas show-
ing  rates as high as 40.7 per 
cent. 

This is according to Associ-
ation of Physicians of India 
(API) data from an ICMR 
study.  The API has launched 
campaign aiming to  reduce 
prevalence of high blood 
pressure by 25 per cent  by 
2025.  

Young adults are currently 
at risk of developing hyper-
tension and its life-threaten-
ing complications including 
heart attacks, which have 

surged among youths. 
The campaign covers 50 

Youth Awareness Pro-
grammes, targeting college 
students to stress on impor-
tance of early blood pressure 
monitoring.  

The Digital Outreach pro-
gramme engages over 10 mil-
lion individuals through 
bpincontrol.com, social 
media, and influencer collab-
orations.  

API has designated 18th of 
every month as, Take charge 
at 18 – BP Screening Day, en-
couraging all adults to priori-
tise regular blood pressure 
checks to protect heart health. 

Gandhi Medical College 
professor Dr Lokendra Dave 
said, “Fast food is responsible 
for it as there is no dearth of 
salt, sugar and maida in food 
items.  It is major concern that 
over 40 per cent prevalence of 
hypertension is in youths of 
cities.”  

Hypertension 
prevalence 40.7% 
in urban youths

Guest teachers encounter 
issues accessing their 
details on portal

OUR STAFF REPORTER 
BHOPAL 

Bollywood film director 
Rajkumar Hirani will be con-
ferred the Madhya Pradesh 
government's Kishore 
Kumar Samman for screen-
play for the year 2023. 

An official from the culture 
department told Free Press 
that the felicitation ceremony 
will be held in the legendary 
singer's hometown Khandwa 
on October 13 to mark his 
37th death anniversary. The 
official said that Hirani will 
personally receive the award. 

Hirani is known for films 
such as  Munna Bhai MBBS ,  

3 Idiots  and  PK . His last film 
was 2023's social drama  
Dunki , starring Shah Rukh 
Khan, Taapsee Pannu and 
Vicky Kaushal. The event will 
also feature 'Kishore Night', a 
special musical tribute to the 
legendary singer by Neeraj 
Shridhar and his team at the 
Police Parade Ground in 
Khandwa. 

Rajkumar Hirani to 
receive Kishore 
Kumar Samman 

OUR STAFF REPORTER 
BHOPAL 

The Indian Institute of Archi-
tects (IIA), Bhopal Chapter 
celebrated World Architec-
ture Day with participation 
from architects, design pro-
fessionals, and students at 
Gauhar Mahal in the city on 
Sunday on theme ‘Intricate 
Weaving of Art, Architecture 
& Technology’. 

The event showcased 
architectural excellence 
alongside community en-
gagement and creative col-
laboration. The focus was on 
addressing the challenges of 
modern cities, integrating 
technology, and promoting 
sustainable architectural 
practices. 

The highlights of the event 

included a digital display by 
the knowledge partner and 
On-the-Spot Competitions fea-
turing live painting and pho-
tography contests.  A musical 
performance by the Rang 
Band group added to the vi-
brant atmosphere. The event 
concluded with a networking 
session where professionals 
and architecture enthusiasts 
exchanged ideas and explored 
opportunities for collabora-
tion.  

Chairman of the Bhopal 
Chapter, Akshay Selukar an-
nounced the upcoming Na-
tional Convention Centre 
(NetCon) event in 2025, a Pan-
India level event that will fea-
ture international speakers 
and focus on advancing 
architectural discourse on a 
global scale.   

IIA Bhopal celebrates  
World Architecture Day

Minor held with 2-wheelers 
OUR STAFF REPORTER 
BHOPAL 

The Kolar police on Sunday 
detained a minor boy engaged 
in vehicle-lifting from the 
Kolar area and have seized 
two Scooties worth Rs 1 lakh 
from his possession.  

As per police, the accused 
committed crime with his 

friend who is also a minor. 
Kolar police station TI Sanjay 
Soni told Free Press that po-
lice received a tip-off on Sun-
day about a suspicious youth 
spotted at a ground in Ban-
jari along with a two-
wheeler, which was allegedly 
stolen.  The police rushed to 
scene and detained minor 
who confessed to have com-

mitted the theft. 
He told police that he had 

stolen another two-wheeler 
too from the area and was as-
sisted by one of his friends in 
the crime. The police have 
seized both the scooties 
valued at Rs 1 lakh and have 
detained minor boy. They are 
on the lookout for his friend, 
who is also a minor.   
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